
TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS November 14, 2016

CLARK COUNTY FOREST

Qualified Non-Qualified

33-15 0 0 10,085.00$           

30-16 3 0 33,635.60$           47,912.00$            

32-16 0 0 49,479.00$           

34-16 1 0 5,460.00$             8,455.00$              

35-16 4 0 47,891.70$           92,826.00$            

36-16 3 1 24,150.00$           29,648.15$            

37-16 6 0 121,277.35$         176,593.00$          

38-16 0 0 20,003.15$           

39-16 0 0 16,620.00$           

40-16 1 0 52,939.00$           56,378.20$            

41-16 0 0 25,456.00$           

42-16 2 0 50,215.00$           74,748.00$            

43-16 0 0 16,042.50$           

44-16 3 0 40,675.00$           57,141.80$            

45-16 3 0 84,587.85$           108,681.00$          

46-16 2 0 52,662.65$           84,366.00$            

47-16 0 0 10,709.05$           

48-16 1 0 18,620.40$           18,935.75$            

49-16 0 0 13,419.90$           

50-16 4 0 14,430.00$           18,883.50$            

51-16 0 0 26,749.00$           

52-16 2 0 24,132.40$           38,057.50$            

53-16* 2 0 105,732.80$         142,000.00$          

54-16 5 0 76,458.30$           105,085.00$          

55-16 0 0 15,978.40$           

56-16 0 0 15,606.40$           

57-16 0 0 48,159.80$           

58-16* 3 0 29,713.80$           56,645.04$            

Totals 45 1 1,050,890.05$      1,116,355.94$       

*lump sum

28 782,581.85$          

16 1,116,355.94$       

16 43%

12

46 13,631.00

45 852

2.8 81.90$                   

905.00

57

1,233.54$              

Avg. Number of Qualifying Bids Per Tract

Total Number of Qualifying Bids

No Bid

Average Acreage of Sold Tracts

Acres Sold

Average $ per Cord Equivalent Sold

Average Cord Equivalent/Sold Tract

No Bid

No Bid

Number of Tracts Offered

Bid ValueHigh Bidder

Solberg Logging

Delaney Forest Products

Appraised Value

Percent Increase Over Appraised Value

Total Bid Value of Tracts Sold

Burkey's Lumber, LLC

No Bid

Total Appraised Value of Tracts Sold

Total Number of Bids

Wiitala Vozka Logging

No Bid

Number of Tracts with No Bids

Number of Tracts with Qualifying Bids

Dairyland Forest Products

Country Forest Products

Delaney Forest Products

No Bid

Number of BidsTract 

Number

Average $ per Acre Sold 

Cord Equivalent Volume Sold

No Bid

Ule Logging

Kron Logging

Number of Tracts Receiving Bids

Frank Gurklis

Delaney Forest Products

No Bid

Lake States Timber

Delaney Forest Products

Delaney Forest Products

No Bid

Tlusty Logging, Inc

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Tigerton Lumber


